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The definitive story of the medium that defines our times

The Big Screen tells the enthralling story of the movies: their rise and spread, their remarkable influence over
us, and the technology that made the screen as important as the images it carries.
But The Big Screen is not another history of the movies. Rather, it is a wide-ranging narrative about the
movies and their signal role in modern life. The celebrated film authority David Thomson takes us around
the globe, through time, and across many media to tell the complex, gripping, paradoxical story of the
movies. He tracks the ways we were initially enchanted by movies as imitations of life?the stories, the stars,
the look?and how we allowed them to show us how to live. At the same time, movies, offering a seductive
escape from everyday reality and its responsibilities, have made it possible for us to evade life altogether.
The entranced audience has become a model for powerless and anxiety-ridden citizens trying to pursue
happiness and dodge terror by sitting quietly in a dark room.
Does the big screen take us out into the world or merely mesmerize us? That is Thomson's question in this
grand adventure of a book, vital to anyone trying to make sense of the age of screens?the age that, more than
ever, we are living in.
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From reader reviews:

Leticia Brewster:

The book The Big Screen: The Story of the Movies will bring you to the new experience of reading the book.
The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. When you try to find new book to see, this book very ideal
to you. The book The Big Screen: The Story of the Movies is much recommended to you to learn. You can
also get the e-book through the official web site, so you can more readily to read the book.

Annetta Doucette:

Is it you who having spare time then spend it whole day simply by watching television programs or just lying
on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This The Big Screen: The Story of the Movies can be the
reply, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your extra time by reading
in this completely new era is common not a geek activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?

Michele Williams:

As a college student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library as
well as to make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's internal
or real their hobby. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to
presently there but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not important,
boring and can't see colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important to suit your
needs. As we know that on this period, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says,
ways to reach Chinese's country. So , this The Big Screen: The Story of the Movies can make you feel more
interested to read.

Ronald Dotson:

A lot of people said that they feel uninterested when they reading a book. They are directly felt the item
when they get a half parts of the book. You can choose the book The Big Screen: The Story of the Movies to
make your own reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading ability is developing when you
including reading. Try to choose easy book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle the sensation
about book and examining especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to open up a book and go
through it. Beside that the reserve The Big Screen: The Story of the Movies can to be a newly purchased
friend when you're feel alone and confuse with the information must you're doing of this time.
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