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At the graduation party of her high school class, Michelle, an attractive eighteen-year old, is the victim of an
intended rape. When she is taken home, she discovers that her father has died of an unexpected heart attack,
leaving her deeply in debt. She is determined to save the family farm and her beloved Arabian horses. Her
faithful housekeeper points out that her only asset is her good looks, and brings in a retired stripper to show
her the moves. Michelle is a big success as a stripper and moves into wealthy, cultivated circles, where she
develops poise and sophistication. She pays off her debt and keeps the farm. At her class reunion on New
Years Eve, she meets the classmate whom she loves. They click, are wed, and settle on the farm to raise
Arabian horses. A series of interesting characters and surprising events keep this light-hearted romance
moving along.STRIPPER is the first of a trilogy by Dawn Splendour, and will be followed by ELSINORE
and JESSICA.
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From reader reviews:

Alexandra Sauer:

This Stripper: A Romance Novel are reliable for you who want to certainly be a successful person, why. The
key reason why of this Stripper: A Romance Novel can be one of several great books you must have is
actually giving you more than just simple studying food but feed a person with information that might be
will shock your preceding knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it everywhere you go and
whenever your conditions throughout the e-book and printed people. Beside that this Stripper: A Romance
Novel forcing you to have an enormous of experience for instance rich vocabulary, giving you demo of
critical thinking that we know it useful in your day action. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Mary Olive:

Many people spending their period by playing outside together with friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by studying a book.
Ugh, ya think reading a book really can hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It okay you can
have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Stripper: A Romance Novel which
is obtaining the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's see.

Angela Joseph:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our understanding for everything. By a e-book we can
know everything we really wish for. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year
has been exactly added. This e-book Stripper: A Romance Novel was filled regarding science. Spend your
spare time to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines competence. Some people has diverse feel
when they reading a book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can sense enjoy to read a guide. In the
modern era like now, many ways to get book that you simply wanted.

Christine Cote:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got scholars? We believe that that query was
given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. Therefore you
know that little person like reading or as examining become their hobby. You have to know that reading is
very important and also book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your
own personal teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update with regards to something by book.
Many kinds of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is actually Stripper: A Romance
Novel.
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