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With the bravura storytelling and pungent authenticity of detail she brought to her acclaimed Lymond
Chronicles, Dorothy Dunnett presents The House of Niccolò series. The time is the 15th century, when
intrepid merchants became the new knighthood of Europe. Among them, none is bolder or more cunning
than Nicholas vander Poele of Bruges, the good-natured dyer's apprentice who schemes and swashbuckles
his way to the helm of a mercantile empire.
      In 1462, Nicholas is a wealthy 21-year-old. His beloved wife has died. His stepchildren have locked him
out of the family business. He and his private army are the target of multiple conspiracies. And both
contenders for the throne of Cyprus, the brilliant Queen Carlotta and her charismatic, sexually ambivalent
brother James, are demanding his support. Walking a tightrope of intrigue, Dunnett's hero juggles
adversaries and allies, from the delectable courtesan Primaflora to the Mameluke commander Tzani-Bey al
Ablak, a man of undiluted evil. Masterfully paced, alive with sensual delights, Race of Scorpions confirms
Dorothy Dunnett as the grande dame of the genre.
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From reader reviews:

David Dugas:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add your
knowledge by the reserve entitled Race Of Scorpions (House of Niccolo Dorothy Dunnett). Try to stumble
through book Race Of Scorpions (House of Niccolo Dorothy Dunnett) as your pal. It means that it can for
being your friend when you feel alone and beside those of course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is
very fortuned for yourself. The book makes you a lot more confidence because you can know everything by
the book. So , we need to make new experience as well as knowledge with this book.

Henry Reavis:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be upgrade about what going on or details even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era which can be always change and move ahead. Some of you
maybe can update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to
you actually is you don't know what one you should start with. This Race Of Scorpions (House of Niccolo
Dorothy Dunnett) is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what
you want and wish in this era.

Carl Kile:

Now a day those who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not require people to be aware of each info they get. How a lot more to be
smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Reading a book can
help persons out of this uncertainty Information specifically this Race Of Scorpions (House of Niccolo
Dorothy Dunnett) book because book offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course the information in this
book hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Angela Thomas:

The reserve untitled Race Of Scorpions (House of Niccolo Dorothy Dunnett) is the e-book that
recommended to you to learn. You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to you. The
language that author use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The writer was did a lot of
investigation when write the book, to ensure the information that they share to you personally is absolutely
accurate. You also might get the e-book of Race Of Scorpions (House of Niccolo Dorothy Dunnett) from the
publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.
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