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The yearly volumes of Censored, in continuous publication since 1976 and since 1995 available through
Seven Stories Press, is dedicated to the stories that ought to be top features on the nightly news, but that are
missing because of media bias and self-censorship. The top stories are listed democratically in order of
importance according to students, faculty, and a national panel of judges. Each of the top stories is presented
at length, alongside updates from the investigative reporters who broke the stories.
Beyond the Top 25 stories, additional chapters delve further into timely media topics: The Censored News
and Media Analysis section provides annual updates on Junk Food News and News Abuse, Censored Déjà
Vu, signs of hope in the alternative and news media, and the state of media bias and alternative coverage
around the world. In the Truth Emergency section, scholars and journalists take a critical look at the
US/NATO military-industrial-media empire. And in the Project Censored International section, the meaning
of media democracy worldwide is explored in close association with Project Censored affiliates in
universities and at media organizations all over the world.
A perennial favorite of booksellers, teachers, and readers everywhere, Censored is one of the strongest life
signs of our current collective desire to get the news we citizens need—despite what Big Media tells us.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Chapman:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive currently, people
have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place and
notice by simply surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated it for a while is
reading. Sure, by reading a book your ability to survive boost then having chance to stand than other is high.
For you personally who want to start reading the book, we give you this specific Censored 2001: Featuring
25 Years of Censored News and the Top Censored Stories of the Year book as beginning and daily reading
guide. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Jennifer McMorris:

The reserve with title Censored 2001: Featuring 25 Years of Censored News and the Top Censored Stories of
the Year includes a lot of information that you can find out it. You can get a lot of help after read this book.
This kind of book exist new information the information that exist in this book represented the condition of
the world right now. That is important to yo7u to know how the improvement of the world. This specific
book will bring you within new era of the syndication. You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so
you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Janet Medley:

Does one one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Attempt to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't ascertain book by its deal with may
doesn't work the following is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not while
fantastic as in the outside appearance likes. Maybe you answer might be Censored 2001: Featuring 25 Years
of Censored News and the Top Censored Stories of the Year why because the great cover that make you
consider regarding the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or content is definitely fantastic as
the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly show you to pick up this book.

Nancy Landry:

You can spend your free time to read this book this reserve. This Censored 2001: Featuring 25 Years of
Censored News and the Top Censored Stories of the Year is simple bringing you can read it in the area, in
the beach, train and soon. If you did not have much space to bring the printed book, you can buy the
particular e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can save typically the book in your smart phone.
Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.
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